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16-05-2017

The Principal

EMEA College of Arts & Science
Kumminiparamba Po, Kondotti,
Malappuram Dt, Kerala-673638

Speed Post -

Dr. Jagdish Arora
Director, Inflibnet Centre,
Gandhinagar,

Infocity Gandhinagar - 382007. Gujarat, INDIA.

Sub:- Request for renewal of membership of INFLIBNET NLIST - Forwarding of.
Ref :- Quotation dated (Website).

I am forwarding herewith the Demand Draft (N0.658908) of Rs. 5750/- (five thousand

seven hundred fifty rupees only) towards the fee for renewal of the membership of INFLIBNET-

NLIST. Kindly acknowledge the same and do the further steps to provide the service of -
INFLIBNET- NLIST to our college.

Yours faithfully
) M
Demand Draft for Rs. 5750/- _ [‘[’I:_,I‘lffll_pal .
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Fwd: Payment Acknowledge NLIST Programme

a2 ot
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Riyad Ali <amriyad@gmail.com> 6:29 AM (6 hours ago)

to me, principal

P //—:’_“—r:-»_ ::..'« .
- gun Trofmimy iPhone

AT - : v
_,o’f/" }\ ~Begin forwarded Message:
#6512 . .
‘(/'.:F. { _From; f',gaymentiﬁfo@inflibnet.ac.m" <paymentinfo@inflibnet.ac.in>
A0 Date: 26 May2017 at 9:45:21 PMIST
v | To: Prirfcipal .<-;ﬁncipal@emeacollege.ac.in>
r ) S'ulbj'éfct:'l”éyment Acknowledge_NLIST Programme
To:
Principal,

E.M.E.A. College of Arts and Science

Dear Sir,

This is to acknowledge that your payment for Rs 5750 vide DD/Cheque/RTGS/NEFT No. 658908 dated
12/05/2017, State Bank of India towards annual membership fee of NLIST Programme for the period
01/04/2017 to 31/03/2018 has been received on 26/05/2017

(C : Kindly note that the annual membership fee has been revised from August 2015. For details, please
visit our website at http://nlist.inflibnet.ac.in/join.php and send the remaining amount RS.0.

You can download the above fee receipt along with invoice after realisation of the payment, from
http://nlist.inflibnet.ac.in/ddinfo.php.

For any queries regarding NLIST Payment, please mail to paymentinfo@inflibnet.ac.in .

Important: If you have any access problem or having no userlID and password for accessing NLIST e-
resources, kinldy send a separate mail along with an authorisation letter[docx] to
ollege@inflibnet.ac.in. We will happy to provide userlD and password to your college.

Mnking you.
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